
MASTER FEES AND CHARGES SCHEDULE
REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

CITY CLERK
1201 100% DOCUMENT CERTIFICATION Each document 15.00

1202 100% CANDIDATE NOMINATION FILING City Council 25.00

Mayor 25.00

1203 N/A MUNICIPAL CODE BOOK SUPPLEMENTS First page 0.60

Each additional page 0.10

1204 100% DUPLICATION OF COUNCIL MEETING Per copy plus 1.25

  Cost of recording medium if not provided

1205 50% POLITICAL REFORM ACT LATE FILING Per day late (maximum $100) 10.00

1206 N/A CANDIDATE STATEMENT FILING  None

1207 N/A PASSPORT APPLICATION Per application 25.00

  (Fee set by Federal government.)

1208 100% PASSPORT PHOTO Per photo 9.00

Yellow  no change

Green updated

Page 1



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

FINANCE
2301 100% TRANSIT PERMIT Per application 214.00

   RMC 5.40.050, 5.65.040(b), 5.65.070(b) (Vehicle for hire, convalescent transport service,

and renewal of convalescent transport service)

2302 100% TAXICAB FRANCHISE APPLICATION Per initial application 1,400.00

    RMC Title 3.30 Per renewal application 1,200.00

2303 100% STREET VENDOR REGULATION/PERMIT Applicant/Business - per year (1 cart) 244.00

    RMC Title 5.38.040 Each additional cart - per year 10.00

2304 75% CLOSE-OUT SALE REGULATION/PERMIT License fee (first 10 days) 80.00

     RMC 5.16.060 Each additional day 4.00

Extension fee (to extend license term) 40.00

Each additional day 4.00

No license including extensions can exceed 120

  days.

2305 50% BICYCLE REGISTRATION/LICENSE New registration 4.00

    RMC 10.64.030 Annual renewal, license transfer or replacement 2.00

        

2306 100% RETURNED CHECK (NSF) PROCESSING Initial returned check 25.00

Each subsequent returned check 35.00

2307 0% NEW BUSINESS REGULATION None

2308 100% COLLECTIONS PAYMENT PLAN Setup 10.00

Per monthly payment (Maximum 24 months) 6.00

Page 2



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - BUILDING
2601 100% BUILDING PLAN CHECK Plan Review fee - 100% of building permit fee as

    RMC Title 16.04.372 established in section 2602 below

    RMC Title 16.04.372 Repetitive Plan Check - Tracts

Plan Review fee - 100% of building permit fee for each

discrete model, plus

Each repetitive building (of such discrete model) 250.00

    RMC Title 16.04.372 Moved-on House

Minimum or 250.00

based on valuation of improvements, whichever is greater

    RMC Title 16.04.372 Agua Mansa and Local Enterprise Zones

  20% reduction for certain developments in these 

  enterprise zones (Criteria - Att. 1, Page 4)

Above fees (excluding permit issuance fee) are

  subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

    RMC Title 16.04.380 Fee for processing plan review fee refund 35.00

Page 3



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - BUILDING
2602 100% BUILDING PERMIT AND INSPECTION Permit Issuance Fee + 25.00

    RMC Title 16.04.372 Building Permits (based on total  per sq. ft. valuation )

     Apartment Houses 87.00

     Auditoriums or Theaters 86.60

     Banks 122.90

     Bowling Alleys 58.70

     Churches 84.20

     Convalescent Hospitals 100.10

     Dwellings 84.60

     Homes for the Elderly 91.50

     Hotels and Motels 83.00

     Industrial Plants 43.70

     Medical Offices 99.90

     Offices 80.60

     Private Garages 24.30

     Public Buildings 107.00

     Restaurants 96.00

     Schools 82.90

     Stores and Services Stations 64.30

     Service Station Canopies 28.00

     Warehouses or Public Garages 34.20

     Miscellaneous - based on contract or

          Building Official determination

Additional Fees Based on Valuation

Valuation                /              Base fee     plus 

$1-$500                                Base Fee 30.00

$501-$2,000                  $30.00 for 1st $500 + $10/per $500

$2001-$25,000               $60.00 for 1st $2,000 +  $9/per $1000

$25,001-$50,000            $267.00 for 1st $25,000 + $65/per $10,000

$50,001-$100,000          $429.50 for 1st $50,000 + $45/per $10,000

$100,001-$500,000        $654.50 for 1st $100,000 + $35/per $10,000

$500,001-$1,000,000     $2,054.50 for 1st $500,000 + $30/per $10,000

Over $1,000,000            $3,554.50 for 1st $1,000,000+ $20/per $10,000

Electrical Work (Attachment 1, Page 1

Heating/Air Conditioning Work (Att. 1, Page 2)

Plumbing Work (Att.1, page 3)

Page 4



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - BUILDING
2602 100% BUILDING PERMITS AND INSPECTIONS Tent, grandstand, or other temporary structure 25.00

     RMC Title 16.04.372

(continued) Storm drain additive fee, if applicable

     Each trailer or mobile home space 466.00

     Each single family residence + 186.00

          Each 100 sq. ft. over 750 sq. ft. roof area 28.00

               (Including accessory buildings)

Building not otherwise covered - Base fee  + 186.00

     Each 100 sq. ft. of roof area between 750-3,000 28.00

     If 3,000+ sq. ft of roof area, per sq. ft. over 3,000 0.06

        plus each sq. ft. of site area 0.02

20% reduction for certain developments in the 

Agua Mansa Enterprise Zone and/or Local

Enterprise Zones (Criteria - Att. 1, page 4)

     RMC Title 16.04.330 Transfer of issued permit 15.00

     RMC Title 16.04.390 Processing a permit fee refund 35.00

     RMC Title 16.20.080 Building moving application + 40.00

Each notice request to be sent by City 1.50

Pre-application inspection:

     Inside City limits 60.00

     Outside City limits (+$2.00/mile or fraction) 60.00

         (mileage computed one-way from City limits) 

Building moving permit 50.00

Appeals 25.00

Labor Code Section 3800 statement fee 10.00

Above fees (excluding permit issuance fee) are

  subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 5



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - BUILDING
2606 100% SPECIAL INSPECTIONS Substandard Conditions or Seismic Code

Per inspection 122.00

Permit issuance fee 25.00

Inspection fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2607 100% BUILDING MODIFICATION/ALT MATERIAL Per application 670.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2608 100% APPEAL OF BUILDING OFFICIAL Per application 2,334.00

2609 100% BUILDING DOCUMENT ARCHIVING Per sheet - microfilming 2.00

  (Includes Fire Prevention) Per image - electronic archiving 2.00

2610 100% SPECIAL DEPUTY REGISTRATION Per application 63.00

  Uniform Building Code section 306(b) Each additional category on same application 15.00

Page 6



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING
REDUCTION OF PERMIT OR PLAN CHECK Fees established under Sections 2602, 2609, 2721

FEES OR CHARGES FOR AGE-RESTRICTED 2752, 2770 or 5201 shall be reduced by 60%  on 

SENIOR CITIZEN HOUSING DEVELOPMENT developments on which a covenant limiting

   Civil Code section 51.3 occupancy, residency and use has been or will be 

recorded prior to issuance of a building permit

2701 80% AMENDMENT TO ZONING TEXT Per application 2,790.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2703 80% PUBLIC HEARING ADVERTISEMENT/ Administrative fee 161.00

  READVERTISEMENT Cost of advertisement 85.00

2705 80% ZONING LETTER Per application 237.00

2706 80% SITE PLAN REVIEW Per initial application 7,954.00

Per revised application 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2707 80% MINOR CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT REVIEW Per application 1,535.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2708 80% CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT REVIEW Per application 5,775.00

Revised application 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2712 80% TIME EXTENSION REVIEW Per application 247.00

    RMC Titles 18 and 19 Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2713 80% PARCEL MAP OR WAIVER REVIEW Per new application 4,175.00

    RMC Chapter 18.48.010 Per Revised application 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 7



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING
2714 80% MINOR CUP - ALCOHOL/ENTERTAINMENT/ Per application 3,276.00

  HOUSING Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2717 80% CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT (CUP) - Per application 7,384.00

  ALCOHOL/ENTERTAINMENT/HOUSING Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2719 80% TENTATIVE TRACT/REVERSION TO Per application with 10 lots or less 6,291.00

    ACREAGE MAP REVIEW Per application with more than 10 lots 8,726.00

    RMC 18.48.010

Revised application 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2723 80% VESTING MAP REVIEW Per application with 10 lots or less 10,528.00

Per application with more than 10 lots 14,972.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2725 80% PLANNED RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT Per application 8,157.00

  PERMIT REVIEW

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 8



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING

2730 80% REZONING REQUEST REVIEW Per application plus 3,529.00

     RMC Title 19 Finalization processing (per application) 331.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2732 80% REZONING REQUEST TIME EXTENSION Per application 1,162.00

  WITH HEARING Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2739 80% DAY CARE PERMIT Per application 326.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2740 80% ADMINISTRATIVE VARIANCE REVIEW With notice

     RMC Title 19      Per application 1,066.00

Without notice

     Per application 681.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 9



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING
2743 80% STREET/ALLEY VACATION/TRAFFIC Per application 8,290.00

  PATTERN MODIFICATION REVIEW

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

(Filing fee shall be reduced by 50% for a project

  meeting requirements of City Council policy, provided

  there shall be no charge to applicant if the City

  initiates the action.)

2744 80% CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE Per application 624.00

  INVESTIGATION

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2745 80% MODIFICATIONS OF CONDITIONS REVIEW Per application + 10% General Plan surcharge 1,147.00

2746 80% TEMPORARY USE PERMIT Per application- Minor + 10% General Plan surcharge 128.00

Per application- Major + 10% General Plan surcharge 455.00

Except no fee for non-commercial car washes

2747 80% NONCONFORMING STATUS REVIEW Per application + 10% General Plan surcharge 1,325.00

2748 80% CONDOMINIUM CONVERSION Per application + 10% General Plan surcharge 5,035.00

2750 80% WATER QUALITY MANAGEMENT Per application + 10% General Plan surcharge 455.00

  PROGRAM - PRELIMINARY

2751 80% INITIAL ENVIRONMENTAL STUDY SINGLE Per application 1,391.00

  FAMILY RESIDENTIAL (SFR) GRADING

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 10



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING
2752 80% INITIAL ENVIRONMENTAL STUDY Per application (with grading) 1,894.00

Per application (without grading) 1,173.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2753 80% ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT REPORT Per report (or actual cost if greater) 30,584.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2758 80% AIRPORT LAND USE COMMISSION (ALUC) Per application 1,299.00

  APPEAL Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2760 80% DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT Per application 11,032.00

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2764 80% GENERAL PLAN AMENDMENT REVIEW Per application 6,925.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2766 80% SPECIFIC PLAN REVIEW Per application or actual cost if greater 17,879.00

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 11



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING

2770 80% PLOT PLAN/ELEVATION DESIGN REVIEW Per application 1,667.00

     (or Certificate of Appropriateness Review)

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2771 80% LANDSCAPE/IRRIGATION PLAN REVIEW Per application 937.00

     (or Certificate of Appropriateness Review)

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2772 80% ADMINISTRATIVE SIGN REVIEW Per sign application

     Signs less than 25 sq. ft. 120.00

     Signs between 25 and 150 sq. ft. 322.00

     Signs 150 sq. ft. and larger 457.00

Per application to establish sign criteria 705.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2774 80% STREET DESIGN REVIEW (REVERSE Per application 375.00

  FRONTAGE)

Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 12



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING

2777 80% MINOR REVIEW - SINGLE FAMILY Per application 578.00

  RESIDENTIAL PLOT PLAN/ELEVATIONS

     (or Certificate of Appropriateness Review) Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2778 80% MINOR REVIEW - SINGLE FAMILY RESI- Per application 355.00

  DENTIAL LANDSCAPE/IRRIGATION PLANS

     (or Certificate of Appropriateness Review) Revised plan 67% of original fee

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2785 80% ADMINISTRATIVE DESIGN REVIEW - Per application 312.00

  REPAINT Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2787 100% GENERAL PLAN MAINTENANCE AND Applied to development related services as

  UPDATE      provided here in.

2788 N/A ANNEXATION PROCESSING None

2790 80% PLANNING APPEAL All cases appealed to City Council except, there 1,392.00

    shall be no fee for non-applicant appealing Planning

    Commission map decision in the RA-5 and RC zone

     or a non-applicant of a variance case.

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2792 80% MILLS ACT PRESERVATION REVIEW Per application 86.00

Per Contract/Review/Initiation process 489.00

2793 80% STREET NAME CHANGE Per application 2,886.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 13



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PLANNING

2794 80% LOT LINE ADJUSTMENTS/CONSOLIDATIONS Per application 2,197.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2795 80% SUMMARY VACATION REVIEW Per application 763.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2796 80% ADMINISTRATIVE REVIEW FOR PUBLIC Per application 1,412.00

  CONVENIENCE OR NECESSITY

  (Alcohol License Review) Appeal of determination, per application 200.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

2797 80% PLANNING DOCUMENT IMAGING Processing Planning case file documents 

into electronic storage unit:

  Per over the counter permit 9.00

  Per administrative case 14.00

  Per planning commission case 51.00

2798 80% WILLIAMSON ACT CONTRACT Per application 631.00

  APPLICATION REVIEW

Page 14



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

CITY-WIDE ACTIVITIES
2901 100% SALE OF PRINTED MATERIAL AND MAPS Attachment 2, Page 1

2902 N/A SOCIAL SERVICES PROGRAM SUPPORT Listed for tracking purposes only.

2904 N/A LIVE STEAMER CLUB SERVICES Listed for tracking purposes only.

2905 N/A VISITOR & CONVENTION BUREAU SUPPORT Listed for tracking purposes only.

2906 100% COPYING OF DOCUMENTS First page (standard sized page) 0.60

Each additional page 0.10

Political Reform Act filings, per sheet 0.10

2907 50% CHILD CARE PROGRAM RENTAL Bobby Bonds Park - per sq. ft. per month 0.33

2910 35% ANIMAL REGULATION Attachment 3, Pages 1-3

2911 100% COPY OF RECORDS FROM MICROFILM Per search for the retrieval of documents 2.00

Per sheet if duplicated by City 1.50

2912 N/A PUBLIC SAFETY COST RECOVERY Listed for tracking purposes only.

2921 100% TRANSPORTATION CENTER MAINTENANCE None

2923 100% DAMAGE TO CITY PROPERTY Fully burdened hourly rate of responding personnel

  plus equipment and material costs.

2924 N/A MUNICIPAL AUDITORIUM RENTAL Negotiated contract

2925 100% SPECIALIZED REPORT REQUEST Preparation of report, per half hour or portion thereof 22.00

  (request requires modification of city records to fulfill)

2926 N/A SALE OF DIGITAL CADME DATA PRODUCTS Attachment 4, Page 1

2927 100% OVERTIME SERVICE REQUEST Fully burdened hourly rate of responding Community

  Development, Fire or Public Works personnel for all

  related time while processing request.

2928 100% FOX THEATER FACILITY Per ticket, in addition to total event price 4.00

Page 15



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - POLICE

3103 100% POLICE SECURITY SERVICE Requested by special event, per officer per hour 77.00

    RMC Title 2.28 Plus administrative costs

     Public agencies - 20% of above fee

     Non-public entities - 40% of above fee

For special events when security determined necessary

  by Chief of Police, 100% cost recovery from 

  private entity

3106 100% NOISE DISTURBANCE RESPONSE Per call-back Actual Cost

  CALL-BACK (service is secondary to RMC Title 9.07)

3107 100% DRIVING UNDER THE INFLUENCE (DUI) Fully burdened hourly rate of responding personnel

  ACCIDENT RESPONSE INVESTIGATION/

  REPORTING Limited to $12,000 per accident

3108 100% BACKGROUND INVESTIGATION Per investigation 20.00

3109 N/A FINGERPRINT PROCESSING Per request 10.00

    California Penal Code 13300

3110 100% VEHICLE CITATION CORRECTION Per inspection 18.00

  INSPECTION

3111 100% SECURITY ALARM REGULATION/PERMIT Permit 57.00

    RMC 5.58.070, 5.58.210

3113 100% CONCEALED WEAPON BACKGROUND Initial application 100.00

  INVESTIGATION/PERMIT Renewal 25.00

   California Penal Code 12054 Amended license 10.00

Psychological testing - actual cost up to 150.00

Page 16



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - POLICE

3114 75% ABANDONED VEHICLE REMOVAL Original inspection - no charge

Second inspection - no charge, if corrected

Second inspection - if continued investigation 25.00

Third inspection - no charge, if corrected

Final inspection and removal of vehicle 150.00

Charge to remove and dispose of vehicle actual cost

Vehicle release (exclusive of Safe Streets Act) 60.00

  Free for vehicles towed as a result of: traffic

  accident, public service, or a search warrant.

Fees may be appealed to and waived by a Police

  Hearing Officer in hardship cases.

3115 100% SPECIAL COMPUTER PRINT-OUT SERVICE Per request 85.00

  (computer search of calls & similar services)

3116 N/A STATUTORY REGISTRATION None

3117 100% REPRODUCTION OF CRIME SCENE Public Records Act Request

  PHOTOS    Photo negative first print 6.50

     each additional photo negative print 0.45

   Digital photo print 4.15

     each additional digital print 0.10

  CD with images from film negatives 31.75

  CD with images from digital source 12.45

Subpoena Request

   Photo negative first print 7.80

     each additional photo negative print 0.35

   Digital photo print 5.40

     each additional digital print 0.12

  CD with images from film negatives 27.30

  CD with images from digital source 13.65

3119 100% POLICE REPORT COPYING Traffic Incident Reports 12.00

Non-Traffic Incident Reports

     First page 0.60

     Each subsequent page 0.10

Page 17



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - POLICE
3120 75% PARKING ENFORCEMENT Base fine per violation of RMC titles 9,10 & 16, except: 41.00

  RMC   6.15.020(g)      Residential, GVW 10,000lbs & unpaved lot parking 116.00

  RMC 10.44.043, 10.44.045(b), 10.60.050      Handicapped parking 341.00

  RMC 10.44.065, 10.44.120, 16.32.080      Fire hydrant, prohibited parking, fire lane 46.00

  RMC 10.44.150      Commercial vehicle, disabled 71.00

  RMC 10.44.155      Certain commercial vehicle & trailer parking 116.00

  RMC 10.44.160, 10.44.170      Commercial & recreational vehicle parking 71.00

  RMC 10.44.175      Dwelling/residing in vehicle 116.00

  RMC 10.52.100, 10.52.110      One/two hour parking limits 37.00

  RMC 10.60.070, 10.60.080      Leaving child or animal in vehicle 121.00

  RMC 10.66.040      Vehicles for-sale parked on streets or public land 116.00

Delinquent fine, in addition to Base fine above, if

citation is not resolved per CVC section 40207

statutory time limits for RMC titles 9, 10 & 16, except: 55.00

  RMC   6.15.020(g)      Residential, GVW 10,000lbs & unpaved lot parking 100.00

  RMC 10.44.043, 10.44.045(b), 10.60.050      Handicapped parking 25.00

  RMC 10.44.065, 10.44.120, 16.32.080      Fire hydrant, prohibited parking, fire lane 55.00

  RMC 10.44.150,      Commercial vehicle, disabled 105.00

  RMC 10.44.155      Certain commercial vehicle & trailer parking 100.00

  RMC 10.44.160, 10.44.170      Commercial  & recreational vehicle parking 80.00

  RMC 10.44.175      Dwelling/residing in vehicle 200.00

  RMC 10.52.100, 10.52.110      One/two hour parking limits 45.00

  RMC 10.60.070, 10.60.080      Leaving child or animal in vehicle 23.00

  RMC 10.66.040      Vehicles for-sale parked on streets or public land 100.00

3121 75% CALIFORNIA VEHICLE CODE ENFORCEMENT  Fines as stated in California Vehicle Code except:

  Base fine

 CVC 4000A    Expired registration 116.00

 CVC 5200    License plate missing 66.00

 CVC 5204    License plate month/year tabs 76.00

  Above fines reduced with proof of correction 20.00

  Delinquent fine

 CVC 4000A    Expired registration 25.00

 CVC 5200    License plate missing 25.00

 CVC 5204    License plate month/year tabs 50.00

Page 18



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - POLICE

3124 10% SPECIAL EVENT REGULATION Fee, non-profit organizations 75.00

Fee, for-profit organizations 115.00

Fee, neighborhood block parties 15.00

Fee, modified package run (bicycle or foot) 150.00

Fee, custom package run (bicycle or foot) 225.00

3126 100% REGULATORY LICENSE/SPECIAL PERMITS Poolroom

  RMC 5.28.035(d)      New application 757.00

  RMC 5.28.060      Renewal 435.00

  RMC 5.52.040 Massage establishment

     New application+ 811.00

     For each employee 382.00

     Renewal + 437.00

     For each employee 354.00

Massage therapist

     New application 382.00

     Renewal 354.00

  RMC 9.40.040(a) Adult-oriented business

     New application 811.00

     Renewal 437.00

  RMC 9.40.090(e)      Live Performance application 382.00

     Live Performance renewal 354.00

  RMC 9.42.035 Fortune telling/occult arts

     New application 451.00

           Plus Dept of Justice fingerprinting fees

     Renewal 423.00

Second hand dealer investigation

     New application 333.00

     Renewal 305.00

License to sell weapons investigation

     New application 405.00

     Renewal 284.00

Page 19



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - POLICE
3126 100% REGULATORY LICENSE/SPECIAL PERMITS Solicitor, Taxicab or ambulance operator

(continued)      New application 125.00

     Renewal 125.00

3128 100% BINGO PERMIT Per application 50.00

    RMC 5.60.060   If denied, 1/2 of fee will be refunded

Per renewal 50.00

  If denied, 1/2 of fee will be refunded

3129 100% POLICE TAPE DUPLICATION Public Record Recordings

Per call duplication of 911 Audio tape 7.90

Investigative Recordings

Officer belt recorder audio - per tape 28.00

Patrol unit video per 10-minute recording 50.00

  each additional minute in excess of 10 1.90

Prisoner interview - per tape 53.00

3130 100% VEHICLE RELEASE -SAFE STREETS ACT Per vehicle (exclusive for Safe Streets Act tows) 255.00

  Exclusive for vehicles towed pursuant to the Safe

   Streets Act.

Paid prior to release, clearance form provided by 

  Police Department.  

Fees may be appealed to Police Hearing Officer

  in hardship cases.

3132 N/A REPOSSESSED VEHICLE PROCESSING Note 1

3133 N/A SCHOOL RESOURCE PROGRAM Negotiate contract

3134 100% TOWING REFERRAL SERVICES Per  vehicle, except 65.00

When vehicle tow is determined by City to be:

1. Low-Value Vehicle, or

2. Result of valid request of current Automobile

  Club of America (AAA) member to an Official

  Police Department towing company previously

  contracted by AAA to provide service, or

3. Result of valid prior request for services by 

  vehicle owner/driver of towing company.

Page 20



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - FIRE

3502 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIALS USAGE Attachment 5, Page 1

    PERMIT I

3503 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIALS USAGE Attachment 5, Page 1

    PERMIT II

3504 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIALS USAGE Attachment 5, Page 1

    PERMIT III

3505 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIALS INVESTIGATION Fully burdened hourly rate of responding Fire

  Department personnel

3506 80% FIRE PREVENTION INSPECTION Inspections listed by occupancy group code Phase II

A2, A3, A4, & S 79.00

A1, E, F, I,  & H 158.00

A5 - outdoor amusement park 316.00

B - multi story

     each floor 40.00

B, C, L, & U - single story

     0-299 square feet 20.00

     300-9,999 square feet 40.00

     over 9,999 square feet 79.00

M - retail sales

     0-9,999 square feet 79.00

     over 9,999 square feet 158.00

R- apartment/hotel

     1   - 10 rooms 79.00

     11 - 20 rooms 158.00

     21 - 30 rooms 237.00

     over 30 rooms 316.00

R3-residential licensed facility

     1  - 6 persons 79.00

     7 - 30 persons 158.00

     over 30 persons 198.00

Business Emergency Plan & Vacant Facilities 20.00

Late Payment Penalty

20% of base fee when payment is 30 days past due

100% of base fee when payment is 60 days past due

Page 21



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - FIRE
3509 100% FIREWORKS DISPLAY INSPECTION/PERMIT Per application - regular display 268.00

Per application - large display 829.00

(As determined by Fire Department)

Fully burdened hourly rate of Fire Department personnel

  on stand-by if determined necessary by Fire Chief.

3510 100% REQUESTED FIRE INSPECTION SERVICE Per inspection 104.00

3514 100% FIXED EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS New Systems

  PLAN CHECK      Fixed hood fire protection systems 273.00

          Plus permit fee 25.00

     Halon systems 318.00

          Plus permit fee 25.00

Modifications to Existing Systems

     Fixed hood fire protection systems 180.00

          Plus permit fee 25.00

     Halon systems 210.00

          Plus permit fee 25.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3516 100% CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE WITHOUT Issuance of plan review permit, without inspection 68.00

  INSPECTION

Non-review permits

  Single permit 16.00

  Multiple permits -must be issued at same time for

                              same location 22.00

3517 100% CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE INSPECTION/ Issuance of permit, with field inspection 189.00

  PERMIT

3518 100% REMOVAL OF ABOVE GROUND Initial tank 299.00

  FUEL TANK permit fee 25.00

each additional tank 52.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 22



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - FIRE
3519 100% INSTALL/REMOVE UNDERGROUND Initial tank 522.00

  FUEL TANK permit fee 25.00

each additional tank 104.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3521 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIALS RECORDS Fire Safety Inspector II, hourly rate 134.00

  SEARCH Public Information Representative, hourly rate 65.00

3522 N/A MEDICAL AID RESPONSE Negotiated contract

3524 N/A FIRE COMPANY SECOND REINSPECTION Recovered as fines in citation process

3525 100% ILLEGAL BURN RESPONSE Fully burdened hourly rate of responding personnel

3526 100% ELECTRICAL HAZARD RESPONSE None

3527 100% SPRINKLER SYSTEM PLAN CHECK/ Based on Uniform Building Code valuations.

  INSPECTION Per sq. ft. - residential 1.65

Per sq. ft. - commercial 1.80

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3528 100% TENANT IMPROVEMENT SPRINKLER Based on Uniform Building Code valuations.

  SYSTEM PLAN CHECK Per sq. ft. - residential 0.83

Per sq. ft. - commercial 0.90

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3529 100% FIRE ALARM SYSTEM PLAN CHECK Minimum fee 270.00

Per device (over 10) 4.00

Plus permit fee 25.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3530 100% FIRE PROTECTION UNDERGROUND Per plan 345.00

  SYSTEM PLAN CHECK Plus permit fee 25.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 23



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - FIRE
3531 100% PETROLEUM TANK INSPECTION - ABOVE Inspection fee per site with tank capacity:

  GROUND (APSA)   less than 10,000 gallons 101.00

  10,000 to 100,000 gallons 202.00

  over 100,000 gallons 404.00

3532 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIAL RESPONSE Fully burdened hourly rate of responding Fire

  Department personnel

3533 100% REQUESTED FIRE INVESTIGATION Fully burdened hourly rate of responding Fire

  Department investigation time

3535 100% SPRINKLER SYSTEM PLAN CHECK/ Per sq. ft. (based on Uniform Building Code 1.65

  INSPECTION - MULTIPLE SITE   valuations)

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3536 100% NEW CONSTRUCTION REINSPECTION First two (included in basic fee) No charge

Third and each subsequent reinspection 157.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

3537 100% AMBULANCE FRANCHISE APPLICATION Per application 4,104.00

3538 Market FIRE FACILITY RENTAL Training Classrooms (8 hours)

  Large 125.00

  Small 60.00

Drill Ground Props (8 hours)

  Auto Extrication 50.00

  Class A 100.00

  Confined Space 150.00

  Drafting Pit 100.00

  Drill Tower 150.00

Page 24



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - FIRE

3538 Market FIRE FACILITY RENTAL

(Continued) Drill Ground Props (8 hours)

  Flashover 100.00

  Forcible Entry 50.00

  Hazmat 150.00

  LARRO 100.00

  Rescue Systems 1 150.00

  Trench Rescue 150.00

  Vehicle Fire Area 100.00

  Vent Over Fire 100.00

  Ventilation - Roof 125.00

PUBLIC WORKS - ADMINISTRATION

3123 N/A CROSSWALK PROTECTION None

4101 N/A AIR QUALITY IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM Negotiated contract

Page 25



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC SAFETY - CODE ENFORCEMENT

4110 100% WEED ABATEMENT Original inspection No charge

     RMC 3.31.020 Abatement administrative charge 337.00

     Plus cost of contractor

4112 75% VEHICLE ABATEMENT Original property inspection No charge

     RMC 9.28.060, 9.28.100 2nd inspection, if violation corrected No charge

2nd inspection, if continued investigation required 50.00

3rd inspection, if violation corrected No charge

3rd inspection, if continued investigation required 75.00

Final inspection and removal 100.00

Additional charge per vehicle over one vehicle 50.00

Charge to remove and dispose of vehicles Actual cost

(Fees may be appealed to and waived by a Hearing

  Officer in hardship cases)

4113 100% DANGEROUS BUILDING INSPECTION Original inspection No charge

Per reinspection for non-compliance 245.00

         (free if corrected)

Per abatement (administrative) 1,470.00

    Plus contractor's cost Actual cost

Summary abatement - without notice 282.00

    Plus contractor's cost

Title Release Process - all abatements 139.00

    Plus county recording fees

4116 100% TRASH/NUISANCE ABATEMENT Original inspection No charge

    RMC 3.31.020 Per reinspection for non-compliance 200.00

     (free if corrected)

Per abatement (administrative) 400.00

Plus cost of contractor Actual cost

Summary abatement - without notice 282.00

    Plus contractor's cost

Page 26



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PUBLIC WORKS
4122 100% TRAFFIC PLAN REVIEW Per application 1,753.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4123 100% WATER QUALITY MANAGEMENT Per permit 1,228.00

  PROGRAM - FINAL Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4124 100% INSPECTION CALL-BACK Per call-back 92

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4125 100% PROCESSING FEES Projects involving no offsite improvement plans,

     RMC 19.82.050   but requiring a bond, utilities or public facilities 580.00

Projects involving no offsite improvement plans, 

  but requiring a deed or easement for street right-

  of-way, utilities, or other public facilities 1,129.00

Projects involving no offsite improvement plans,

  but requiring both a bond and a deed or easement

  for street right-of-way, utilities, or other public

  facilities 1,223.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4126 100% PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT TIME EXTENSIONS Projects not requiring modification to bonds or 135.00

documentation

Projects requiring modification to bonds,

documentation or other unusual problems 609.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4127 100% DETERMINATION OF COMPLIANCE Review property for determination if any issues

prevent acceptance as legal parcel 329.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 27



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PUBLIC WORKS

4128 100% SUBDIVISION PLAN CHECK To review plans, other than for Street Trees, adding

  to the City's infrastructure, the plan check fee

  based on estimated construction cost (ECC).

 $0-$24,999.99 ECC 811.00

     Plus 5.1% of ECC

$25,000-$99,999.99 ECC 2,086.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $25,000

$100,000-$199,999.99 ECC 3,848.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $100,000

$200,000-$299,999.99 ECC 6,198.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $200,000

$300,000-and greater ECC 8,548.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $300,000

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4129 100% SUBDIVISION MAP CHECK Map checking fee + 2,523.00

     RMC TITLE 18 Per each number and lettered lot 60.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4130 100% PARCEL MAP, MAP CHECK Map checking fee + 2,547.00

     RMC TITLE 18 Per parcel 70.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 28



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PUBLIC WORKS

4131 100% PARCEL MAP PLAN CHECK To review plans, other than for Street Trees, adding

  to the City's infrastructure, the plan check fee

  based on estimated construction cost (ECC).

 $0-$24,999.99 ECC 811.00

     Plus 5.1% of ECC

$25,000-$99,999.99 ECC 2,086.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $25,000

$100,000-$199,999.99 ECC 3,848.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $100,000

$200,000-$299,999.99 ECC 6,198.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $200,000

$300,000-and greater ECC 8,548.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $300,000

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4132 100% ENGINEERING PLAN CHECK To review plans for construction or other similar 

  (EXCEPT PARCEL MAP AND SUBDIVISION)   applications (excepting parcel map, subdivision &

   RMC 13.16.130   Street tree actions) requiring City approval

Individual Single Family Building Permit on

Existing Lot

     Single plan (street, sewer or storm drain) 1,158.00

     Multiple plans submitted as set + 1,158.00

          Each additional type of plan 189.00

      Revision of approved plan 980.00

           or 6.42% of total est. construction cost

           (whichever is less)

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Continued on next page

Page 29



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PUBLIC WORKS

4132 100% ENGINEERING PLAN CHECK Other than Individual Single Family Building Permit

  (EXCEPT PARCEL MAP AND SUBDIVISION)   Plan check fees are based on Estimated Con-

   RMC 13.16.130   struction Cost (ECC)

(continued)

 $0-$24,999.99 ECC 811.00

     Plus 5.1% of ECC

$25,000-$99,999.99 ECC 2,086.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $25,000

$100,000-$199,999.99 ECC 3,848.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $100,000

$200,000-$299,999.99 ECC 6,198.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $200,000

$300,000-and greater ECC 8,548.00

     Plus 2.35% of ECC over $300,000

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4133 100% PRIVATE DEVELOPMENT INSPECTION Permit issuance fee 25.00

   RMC 13.16.030 Processing fee per permit 384.00

Per hour inspection fee 92.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

FEES DOUBLED IF WORK IS COMMENCED OR

  COMPLETED PRIOR TO OBTAINING PERMIT

  Payment of additional amount shall not exempt

   any person from compliance with RMC 13.16

  nor any other penalty prescribed by law.

Page 30



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PUBLIC WORKS

4134 100% STREET ENCROACHMENT REQUEST Processing fee

     RMC 13.08.015      Single family home owner permit (25% recovery) 150.00

     Non-single family home owner permit 600.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4135 100% STREET OPENING PERMIT/INSPECTION Permit processing fee 436.00

    RMC 13.12.090 Hourly charge for inspection service 92.00

Above fees subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4136 100% GRADING PLAN CHECK Fee based on volume of excavation/fill measured in

  cubic yards (CY)

0-500 cubic yards  Base fee plus 522.00

501-5,000 cubic yards

     each additional 500 CY or fraction thereof 73.00

5,001-50,000 cubic yards

     each additional 5,000 CY or fraction thereof 80.00

50,001-100,000 cubic yards

     each additional 10,000 CY or fraction thereof 102.00

100,001-200,000 cubic yards

     each additional 10,000 CY or fraction thereof 12.00

200,001 cubic yards or more

     each additional 10,000 CY or fraction thereof 7.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

20% reduction for certain developments in the 

Agua Mansa Enterprise Zone and/or Local

Enterprise Zones (Criteria - Att. 1, page 4)

Page 31



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT - PUBLIC WORKS

4137 100% GRADING INSPECTION Permit issuance fee 25.00

  Uniform Building Code 7006 Processing fee per permit 614.00

Per hour inspection fee 92.00

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

4138 100% STREET TREE PLAN CHECK Non-Tract Application

  Base fee 85.00

  Per curb lineal foot of street frontage 0.32

Tract Application

  Base fee 98.00

  Per curb lineal foot of street frontage 0.17

Above fee subject to 10% General Plan Surcharge

Page 32



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

PUBLIC PARKING - PUBLIC WORKS

2309 100% HANDICAPPED PARKING TICKET DISMISSAL Per citation review 23.00

4120 35% PUBLIC PARKING GARAGE OPERATION Negotiated contract

4121 100% PUBLIC PARKING LOT OPERATION Negotiated contract

4147 N/A OVERTIME PARKING Overtime parking, per day 5.00

    RMC 10.52.145     Maximum per calendar month 50.00

For parking of construction, maintenance, service

  or repair vehicles on City streets in excess of

  the time limitations for such parking.

MAINTENANCE - PUBLIC WORKS

4140 100% WIDE, OVERWEIGHT/LONG LOAD Permit fee

  PERMIT REVIEW      Per application 16.00

     Multiple use 90.00

4141 N/A GENERAL UTILITY STREET USAGE/ Fee individually negotiated by City

  FRANCHISE FEE

4142 100% RIGHT-OF-WAY CLEANUP Charge the Fully burdened hourly rate of Public

  Works Department ,Street Maintenance personnel 

  to responsible party

4146 100% HAZARDOUS MATERIAL CLEANUP Charge the Fully burdened hourly rate of Public

  Works Department ,Street Maintenance personnel 

  to responsible party

Page 33



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

UTILITY AND ENTERPRISES - SEWER
4165 N/A PRIVATE CONTRACTOR SEPTIC TANK Note 1

  DISCHARGE

UTILITY AND ENTERPRISES - REFUSE

4182 N/A SELF-HAUL REVIEW Per application 50.00

    RMC 6.04.055   For self hauling permit review of both residential

  and commercial refuse.

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - LIBRARY

5101 N/A LIBRARY ROOM RENTAL Note 1

5102 100% RESERVATION OF LIBRARY MATERIALS None

5103 10% INTER-LIBRARY BOOK RETRIEVAL Per book 1.00

5104 50% RETRIEVAL & COPYING OF PERIODICALS Per page (after 10 free pages) 0.10

Per microfilm copy (after 10 free pages) 0.25

Page 34



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - LIBRARY

5105 60% REPLACEMENT OF LOST CARDS Per card 1.00

5106 100% REPLACING LOST LIBRARY ITEMS Processing fee 10.00

Plus actual cost of replacement

   

5107 100% COUNTY LIBRARY SERVICE (CONTRACT)  Inactive

5108 100% LIBRARY EQUIPMENT RENTAL Per each 15-minutes of use 0.25

Each sheet printed on micro-fiche reader 0.25

5109 N/A LIBRARY ON-LINE RECORD SEARCH None

5110 100% OVERDUE MATERIALS PROCESSING Per day per Library-owned book 0.10

Per day per McNaughton leased book 0.25

Per day per video 1.00

per day per art print 0.50

5111 N/A DAMAGED MATERIAL REPAIRS Note 1

5112 N/A HISTORIC PHOTOGRAPH PROCESSING If negative exists, retrieval and handling fee 5.00

If no negative exists, requesting party shall pay 

for the production of the negative, and it shall

become the property of the Library

5113 N/A OVERDUE COLLECTION FEE If overdue charges exceed $100.00 and are 

more than 28 days overdue, collection fee 5.00

Page 35



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION

5210 30% YOUTH CONTRACT CLASSES Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

Non-resident participants shall also be assessed

     a per class fee of 10.00

5211 0% YOUTH CITY ACTIVITIES None

5212 50% DAY CAMP PROGRAMS Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

Non-resident participants shall also be assessed a

     fee equal to 50% of the resident fee added

     to the resident fee

5213 5% YOUTH CENTER SPECIAL EVENTS Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

5214 75% ADULT CONTRACT CLASS Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

Non-resident participants shall also be assessed

     a separate per class fee of 10.00

5216 0% LOCAL COMMUNITY ACTIVITIES None

5217 Market PICNIC FACILITY RESERVATION/RENTAL Reservation processing fee 25.00

Standard Picnic shelter (8 tables or less)

User Group I (Qualified nonprofit) 60.00

(user groups as defined in Attachment 6) User Group II (Resident, other nonprofit) 75.00

User Group III (Non-resident, commercial) 105.00

Fees are daily rates up to 8 hours

Page 36



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION

5217 Market PICNIC FACILITY RESERVATION/RENTAL Large Picnic shelter (more than 8 tables)

(Continued) User Group I (Qualified nonprofit) 90.00

User Group II (Resident, other nonprofit) 110.00

User Group III (Non-resident, commercial) 155.00

Fees are daily rates up to 8 hours

Park staffing requirements determined by Park &

  Recreation Director, rate per staff per hour 16.00

Moon bounce site permit (all user groups) 20.00

Security deposit 50.00

     Will be refunded (at no charge) less any

     amounts retained by City for damages.

Processing refund request of rental fees 10.00

5218 50% SOCIAL SERVICES OFFICE RENTAL Office space monthly per square foot rental rate 0.46

5219 N/A FACILITY USE WITHOUT CHARGE Listed for tracking purposes only.

5220 Market COMMUNITY CENTER RENTAL Application processing fee 25.00

Processing refund request of rental fees 10.00

Park staffing requirements determined by Park &

  Director, rate per staff per hour 16.00

Alcohol service 125.00

Page 37



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION
5220 Market COMMUNITY CENTER RENTAL Security deposit - Auditorium/Banquet/Ballroom 500.00

(Continued) Security deposit - all other rooms 250.00

(Market rate based rental rates) Rental rates - Attachment 6, Pages 1-2

5221 10% YOUTH SPORTS PROGRAM Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

Non-residents shall also be assessed a fee equal to

      100% of the resident fee added to the resident fee

5222 50% ADULT SPORTS PROGRAM Softball per resident team contracted fee

     resident team = 8 Riverside residents

Volleyball, per resident team 300.00

     resident team = 6 Riverside residents

Non-resident teams shall also be assessed a fee equal

     to 15% of the resident fee added to the

     resident fee

5223 25% TIME FOR TOTS PROGRAM Per resident participant (9-week session) 100.00

Non-resident participants shall also be assessed a fee

     equal to 50% of the resident fee added to

     the resident fee

First half of payment due at registration and

     second half due at beginning of 5th week

Priority registration to residents

5224 50% YOUTH EXCURSIONS Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

Non-resident participants shall also be assessed

     a separate non resident fee of 10.00

Page 38



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION

5225 20% CITY-WIDE SPECIAL EVENTS Summer concerts No charge

Riverside Sport Complex, 4th of July fireworks

     entrance fee per person over 5 years 4.00

Corporate Games Registration fees

     Small company (fewer than 200 employees) 595.00

     Large company (more than 200 employees) 695.00

Tin Man Triathlon

     Preregistered, per individual 30.00

     Preregistered, per team 60.00

     Registration after specific date, per individual 40.00

     Registration after specific date, per team 70.00

Booth space rental, and participant fees at any

     special event not identified shall be set by Park

     and Recreation Department in conformity with

     RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees & Charges

     Schedule.

5226 N/A SPECIAL TRIPS AND TRAVEL Inactive

5227 10% SENIOR CITIZEN PROGRAM Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

5228 25% CHALLENGED CITIZEN ACTIVITIES Friendly Stars Program (6 month membership) 62.00

Non-resident participants assessed a fee

     equal to 75% of the resident fee added to

     the resident fee

5230 N/A YOUTH SUMMER FOOD PROGRAM Negotiated contract

5231 20% RECREATIONAL SWIMMING See Attachment 7

Page 39



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION
5232 50% SWIMMING LESSONS Fee set by Park and Recreation Department in

    conformity with RMC 3.30.030 and Master Fees &

    Charges Schedule.

Non-resident participants shall also be assessed a fee 

     equal to 50% of the resident fee added to

     the resident fee

5233 100% POOL RENTALS 1-100 People (2-hour use) 290.00

101-200 People (2-hour use) 375.00

Priority given to residents for reservation of

     swimming pool facility

20% discount for schools in Riverside and 

     Alvord Unified School District and for

     other Riverside based non-profit organizations

5234 N/A PRIVATE SWIM TEAM POOL USE None.

5235 100% BOATHOUSE BOAT RENTALS Pedal boat rentals, residents per hour 14.00

Non-residents shall also be assessed a fee equal to

     50% of the resident fee added to the resident fee

Permit fee, non-motorized boats

     (valid for 30 days from date of issuance) 5.00

5237 Market USE OF OTHER DEPARTMENTAL Fee set by Park and Recreation Department

  FACILITIES

Park Event Facilities

  (Sites & availability determined by PRCS Director)

  User Group I  Base fee (up to first 8 hrs) 700.00

                          additional hours 35.00

  User Group II  Base fee (up to first 8 hrs) 850.00

                          additional hours 45.00

  User Group III  Base fee (up to first 8 hrs) 1,200.00

                          additional hours 60.00

Page 40



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION
5237 Market USE OF OTHER DEPARTMENTAL

  FACILITIES Park Event Facilities - continued

(Continued)   Rental fees allow site access, additional requests

    or modifications will be charged at the City's cost,

    with fully burdened hourly rates for responding

    Parks, Recreation & Community Services

    (PRCS) staff.

  Application processing 25.00

  Alcohol service 125.00

  Security Deposit  - Refundable

     Rental fees are less than $770 & participation is

     estimated at:

         1 to 100 participants  deposit is 250.00

         101 to 500 participants  deposit is 500.00

         501 or greater participants  deposit is 750.00

     Rental fees are between $770 & $1,200

     participation is estimated at:

         1 to 100 participants  deposit is 500.00

         101 to 500 participants  deposit is 750.00

         501 or greater participants  deposit is 1,000.00

     Rental fees are more than $1,200 & participation

     is estimated at:

         1 to 100 participants  deposit is 750.00

         101 to 500 participants  deposit is 1,000.00

         501 or greater participants  deposit is 1,250.00

Outdoor ball court rentals for Groups I, II, & III

  Tennis court per hour 5.00

  Basketball 1/2 court 5.00

  Court rental security deposit (refundable) 50.00

Artificial turf field complex at Bobby Bonds Park

  Operation fee per hour (non-lighted) 52.00

Page 41



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - PARK AND RECREATION
5240 N/A GOESKE SENIOR CENTER SUPPORT None

5245 75% SENIOR NUTRITION PROGRAM Negotiated contract

MAINTENANCE - PARK AND RECREATION
5253 Market PRIVATE YOUTH GROUP FIELD USAGE For Youth Groups Qualifying per PRCS Department

  criteria for lower rate.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 2.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 2.00

For Youth Groups NOT qualifying per PRCS Dept.

  criteria for lower rate.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 2.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 18.00

        (Game rate prorated to 1/2 hour increments.)

Field rental contracts with rental fees greater than

  $50 require a security deposit of: 250.00

Field lighting is in addition to above rates.

5254 Market PRIVATE ADULT FIELD RENTAL For Qualifying Resident Groups per PRCS Department

  criteria.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 18.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 18.00

        (Field rates prorated to 1/2 hour increments.)

For all other Groups NOT qualifying per PRCS Dept.

  Resident criteria.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 18.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 27.00

        (Field rates prorated to 1/2 hour increments.)

Field rental contracts with rental fees greater than

  $50 require a security deposit of: 250.00

Priority to residents and resident organizations -

  (with physical address in the corporate limits of

  Riverside and with non-profit status)

Processing refund request 10.00

Page 42



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

MAINTENANCE - PARK AND RECREATION
5255 Market PRIVATE YOUTH GROUP FIELD LIGHTING For Youth Groups Qualifying per PRCS Department

  criteria for lower rate.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 2.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 2.00

For Youth Groups NOT qualifying per PRCS Dept.

  criteria for lower rate.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 2.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 18.00

        (Game rate prorated to 1/2 hour increments.)

Penalty for unauthorized lighting use 50.00

    plus per hour per field lighting used 27.00

Lighting fee is in addition to the rental amount set

  forth in item 5253 above.

5256 Market PRIVATE ADULT FIELD LIGHTING For Qualifying Resident Groups per PRCS Department

  criteria.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 18.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 18.00

        (Use rates prorated to 1/2 hour increments.)

For all other Groups NOT qualifying per PRCS Dept.

  Resident criteria.

    Practice/non game use per hour per field 18.00

    Game/competitive use per hour per field 27.00

        (Use rates prorated to 1/2 hour increments.)

Lighting fee is in addition to the rental amount set

  forth in item 5254 above.

5257 N/A LAWN BOWLING GROUNDS MAINTENANCE None

5258 N/A RIVERSIDE COMMUNITY COLLEGE Negotiated contract

  BALLFIELD AND TENNIS COURT

  MAINTENANCE

Page 43



REF. RECOV. CURRENT 

No. % SERVICE TITLE CALCULATION OF FEE AMOUNT

MAINTENANCE - PARK AND RECREATION
5260 Market MOBILE STAGE RENTAL Base Rental Fees by user group

  User Group I  Base fee (up to first 8 hrs) 860.00

                          additional hours 100.00

  User Group II  Base fee (up to first 8 hrs) 1,075.00

                          additional hours 120.00

  User Group III  Base fee (up to first 8 hrs) 1,505.00

                          additional hours 140.00

Application processing 25.00

Delivery and setup 600.00

Security deposit 1,000.00

Park staffing requirements determined by Park &

  Recreation Director, rate per staff per hour 16.00

LEISURE AND CULTURAL - HISTORIC RESOURCES

5301 N/A MUSEUM OPERATION Note 1

5302 N/A HERITAGE HOUSE OPERATIONS Note 1

5303 N/A MISSION INN SUPPORT Note 1

ENTERPRISES - AIRPORT 

5401 N/A AIRPORT OPERATIONS Reserved for future use.

Note 1 -  These services are found in the Fees and Charges Ordinance and thus the Riverside Municipal Code.  Due to the transition

of certain fee information from the Ordinance to the Fees & Charges Resolution, these services must be listed

in the Resolution.  The fees for these services, if any, are not calculated as part of the Annual Fees & Charges Study

prepared by the Finance Division, and are set based on external constraints or analyses performed by other City

Departments.  No changes to these fees are proposed at this time.

Page 44



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 1 

 
Electrical Work.  For each electrical permit issued independent of a building permit, a fee, 
which is in addition to the issuance fee, shall be in accordance with the following schedule: 
 
Each service panel, switchboard or panelboard, including subpanels installed or altered: 
   Service Panels 

  To 200 amps         $12.00 each 
     Over 200 amps to 1000 amps      $24.00 each 

  Over 1000 amps        $48.00 each 
 Switchboard or panelboard, including subpanels: 
    To 600 volts         $25.00 each 
   Over 600 volts         $50.00 each 

 
Per square foot method: 

  Dwellings        $0.04 
Residential Parking Garages      $0.02 
Restaurants         $0.09 
Industrial Plants        $0.09 
Stores, Churches, Offices       $0.04 
Warehouses, Canopies, Covered Parking  

Structures, Aircraft Hangers:   
   0 - 50,000 square feet     $0.02 
   over 50,000 square feet     $0.015 

 Service Stations/Minimarts       $0.07 
Not otherwise listed        $0.04 

 
  Signs           $15.00 each 
  Swimming Pools and or Spas: 
   Swimming Pool or Spa       $25.00 
   Swimming Pool and Spa       $40.00 

    Temporary Power Poles:  
  Temporary Power Pole       $15.00 
  Additional Pole with Fixture or outlet     $  7.50 

Motors, Generators, Transformers, Appliances  
(horsepower, kw, kva) 

   Not over 3        $  5.00 each 
   Over 3, not over 50       $16.00 each 
   Over 50         $33.00 each 

Moved Buildings 
  Each building or structure       $66.00 each 

 Yard Lighting Standards        $3.00 each 
 Outlets or receptacles not otherwise included        $0.50 each 

  Electrical hook-up fee for inspection  
     prior to meter reset:       $12.00 each 
 

ATTACHMENT 1 - Page 1 
 
 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 1 

 
Heating and Air Conditioning Work.  For each heating and air conditioning permit issued 
independent of a building permit, a fee, which is in addition to the issuance fee, shall be in 
accordance with the following schedule: 
 
 Furnace         $11.00 each  
 Other heater         $  9.00 each 
 Alter System         $  9.00 each 
 Mechanical Exhaust Hood       $  6.50 each 
 Appliance vent (not included with appliance)   $  5.00 each 
 Ventilation Fan       $  4.50 each 
 Boilers, Air Conditioning Units: 
  Up to 3 horsepower/tons or 100,000 BTU   $  9.00 each 
  Over 3 to 50 horsepower/tons or 
   100,000 to 175,000 BTU     $22.50 each 
  Over 50 horsepower/tons or 
    over 175,000 BTU      $56.50 each 

Air Handlers         $11.00 each 
Incinerators        $45.00 each 

 
Per square foot method: 

  Dwellings        $0.03 
  Residential Parking Garages    Not Applicable,  
          Per Fixture Fees Apply 

  Restaurants         $0.06 
  Industrial Plants      Not Applicable, 
          Per Fixture Fees Apply 

Stores, Churches, Offices      $0.01 
 

Warehouses, Canopies, Covered Parking  
            Structures, Aircraft Hangers:  

 0 - 50,000 square feet    Not Applicable, 
                Per Fixture Fees Apply 

 over 50,000 square feet    Not Applicable, 
                Per Fixture Fees Apply 

 Service Stations/Minimarts       $0.01 
 Not otherwise listed      Not Applicable, 

               Per Fixture Fees Apply 
Not otherwise indicated       $6.50 each 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 1 - Page 2 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 1 

 
Plumbing Work.  For each plumbing permit issued independent of a building permit, a fee, 
which is in addition to the issuance fee, shall be in accordance with the following schedule: 
    
  Traps          $5.00 each  
  Garbage Disposals or Dishwashers    $5.00 each 
  Sand Traps or Grease Traps     $10.00 each 
  Gas Outlets        $0.75 each 
  Water Piping       $5.00  
  Water Softeners      $3.00 each 
  Yard Sprinklers       $8.00 
   Rainwater Systems      $5.00 per drain 
   Private Sewage System     $50.00 each  
   Building Sewer: 
    Residential      $16.00 each 
    Non-residential     $50.00 each 
   Moved Building       $25.00 each 
   Repair or alteration or Drain or Vent    $5.00 each 
   Backflow Protection Devices     $2.00 each 
   Water Heaters: 
    To 100,000 BTU     $9.00 each 
    Over 100, 000 to 1,000,000 BTU   $22.50 each 
          Over 1,000,000 BTU    $56.50 each 
   Water Heater Gas Vent      $5.00 each  
    

 Per square foot method: 
    Dwellings       $0.04 
    Residential Parking Garages    Not Applicable, Per 
                        Fixture Fees Apply 
    Restaurants       $0.04 
    Industrial Plants      Not Applicable, Per 
           Fixture Fees Apply 
    Stores, Churches, Offices     $0.02 
      
     Warehouses, Canopies, Covered Parking  
      Structures, Aircraft Hangers:   
    0 - 50,000 square feet     Not Applicable, Per 
           Fixture Fees Apply  
    over 50,000 square feet     Not Applicable, Per 
           Fixture Fees Apply 

     Service Stations/Minimarts    $0.03 
     Not otherwise listed     Not Applicable, Per 

          Fixture Fees Apply 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 1 - Page 3 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 1 

 
 
Agua Mansa Enterprise Zone and Local Enterprise Zones.  Notwithstanding anything to 
the contrary, the permit as established by Items (1), (2)(i), (3), (4) and (5) of Paragraph (a) 
of Subsection 2602 to be paid by those new industrial or commercial developments, 
excluding retail firms, located within that portion of the Agua Mansa Enterprise Zone lying 
within the corporate limits of the City of Riverside as said Zone may then be established as 
requested by the City Council and approved by the Executive Committee of the Aqua 
Mansa Industrial Growth Association or within a Local Enterprise Zone as may be 
established from time to time by the City Council creating at least five new permanent jobs 
and by those existing industrial or commercial developments, excluding retail firms, located 
within that portion of the Agua Mansa Enterprise Zone lying within the corporate limits of the 
City of Riverside or within a Local Enterprise Zone as may be established from time to time 
by the City Council who are expanding, which expansion results in an increase of 10% in 
the number of permanent jobs for that business at that location subject to a minimum 
increase of five additional jobs, shall be reduced by twenty percent (20%); provided, 
however, those businesses in a Local Enterprise Zone seeking to qualify for the reduction 
will be required to add value to the existing assessed valuation of the subject property by 
investing at least $500,000.00 over a five-year period in new construction and/or tenant 
improvements.   
 
  To claim the reduction in fees as herein provided, the applicant must submit a verified 
statement in writing to the Building Official prior to the issuance of the permit requesting the 
reduction together with such supporting documentation as may be required by the Building 
Official to establish the applicability of the provisions of this subsection.   
 
  'Retail firms' as used herein shall mean those firms or businesses which derive fifty 
percent or more of its gross receipts from direct and final sales of goods or services to the 
general public.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 1 - Page 4 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 2 

 
 
 To print and sell maps and publications authored by the various City departments or 
contractors, the following charges are hereby established, which charges include sales tax if 
any: 

 
 Cost Study Report dated September 1990 prepared by Management Services 

Institute consisting of two volumes entitled `Report, Cost Control System for the 
City of Riverside, California' and „Report, Appendices, Cost Control System for the 
City of Riverside, California' and any subsequent Cost  

 Control Study     ............................................... $37.35 per set 
 
 Employees Quick Reference Guide   ............................................  $  3.50 each 
 General Plan (text, cover, land use/streets diagram without binder)$31.00 each 
 General Plan Binder ......................................................................  $  4.00 each 
 General Plan Appendix (without binder) ........................................ $ 17.00 each 

General Plan Appendix Binder ......................................................  $  3.00 each 
 Land Use/Streets and Highways Diagrams(one two-sided page)  $ 10.00 each 
 
 Title 10 of the Riverside Municipal Code .......................................  $  2.00 each  
 

Computer Aided Design, Mapping & Engineering (CADME) System products: 
A size plot (8.5 x 11)  ..........................................................  $  3.00 each 

 A size plot with photo (8.5 x 11)  ........................................ . $  6.00 each 
B size plot (11 x 17)  .......................................................... . $  5.00 each 
B size plot with photo (11 x 17)  .........................................  $ 10.00 each 

 
City Map Books  ............................................................................  $  6.00 each 
Photo blue line prints of City - 72 areas (3 x 5 ft.)   ........................ $ 25.00 each 
City Street Map (3 x 5 ft.) .............................................................  $ 25.00 each 
City Street Map - two sheets (6 x 9 ft.)  ........................................... $100.00 set 
Ward Maps (3 x 5 ft.)  .................................................................... $ 25.00 each 
D size plot (34 x 22)  ...................................................................  $120.00 each 
E size plot (34 x 48) .....................................................................  $150.00 each 
D size photo  ...............................................................................  $120.00 each 
E size photo  ................................................................................  $150.00 each 
D size plot and photo  ..................................................................  $240.00 each 
E size plot and photo  ..................................................................  $300.00 each 

 
Hourly charge for custom mapping work  ..............................................  $ 60.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 2 - Page 1 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 3 

 
Dogs and Cats 

Altered dog license - 1 year ...................................................................................................... $16.00 each dog 

Altered dog license- 2 year ......................................................................................................... 25.00 each dog 

Altered dog license - 3 year ........................................................................................................ 35.00 each dog 

  

Unaltered dog license - 1 year ................................................................................................ $100.00 each dog 

Unaltered dog license - 2 year .................................................................................................. 175.00 each dog 

Unaltered dog license - 3 year .................................................................................................. 250.00 each dog 

  

Altered dog license - 1 year (senior citizen) ............................................................................. $10.00 each dog 

Altered dog license - 2 year (senior citizen) ............................................................................... 15.00 each dog 

Altered dog license - 3 year (senior citizen) ............................................................................... 20.00 each dog 

  

Dog license late fee .................................................................................................................. $25.00 each dog 

Dog license late fee (senior citizen) ........................................................................................... 15.00 each dog 

 

New resident dog license late fee ............................................................................................. $25.00 each dog 

  

Transfer of ownership fee - dog ................................................................................................. $6.00 each dog 

  

Dog license replacement tag ...................................................................................................... $6.00 each dog 

  

Cat license ................................................................................................................................... $9.00 each cat 

 

Impound Fee 

Impound fee - 1st offense within 1 year ................................................................................ $40.00 per animal 

Impound fee - 2nd offense within 1 year................................................................................. 90.00 per animal 

Impound fee - 3rd offense within 1 year ............................................................................... 150.00 per animal 

Impound fee - altered/unable to produce dog owned by senior citizen ............................ 50 percent of offense 

Impound fee - animal returned to owner by field officer ........................................................ 30.00 per animal 

  

Boarding fee (per day or part thereof) ...................................................................... $15.00 per animal/per day 

 

Quarantine Fee 

Home quarantine fee ............................................................................................................. $50.00 per animal 

Quarantined animals - housed at a county shelter ............................ $5.00 per animal/per day + boarding fees 

  

Dangerous animal registration - 1 year ............................................................................... $250.00 per animal 

 

Euthanasia and disposal Fee (owner request at shelter) 

Dog - Euthanasia and disposal (owner request at shelter) ........................................................ $25.00 each dog 

Cat - Euthanasia and disposal (owner request at shelter) ............................................................ 25.00 each cat 

Small Animal - Euthanasia and disposal (owner request at shelter)........................................ 25.00 per animal 

  

Owner turn-in Fee 

Owner turn-in fee (animal picked up by field officer) .......................................................... $30.00 per animal 

Owner turn-in fee (animal turned in at the shelter) ................................................................. 20.00 per animal 

 

Trap Fee 

Trap service - first 5 days ................................................................................................. $20.00 first five days 

Trap service - each day after initial 5 days ..................................................................................... 2.00 per day 

Lost or destroyed traps ...................................................................................................................... 90.00 each 

   
 

ATTACHMENT 3 - Page 1 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 3 

 
Microchip Fee  

Microchip - implant at time of adoption.............................................................................. $10.00 each animal 

Microchip - implant at any other times other than adoption ................................................. 20.00 each animal 

  

Adoption Fee 

Adoption fee - dogs .................................................................................................................. $95.00 each dog 

Adoption fee - cats ...................................................................................................................... 75.00 each cat 

Adoption fee - dogs (last chance adoption) ................................................................................ 10.00 each dog 

Adoption fee - cats (last chance adoption) .................................................................................... 5.00 each cat 

Senior citizen/disabled person adoption fee - dogs .................................................................... 65.00 each dog 

Senior citizen/disabled person adoption fee - cats....................................................................... 45.00 each cat 

  

Event fee - dogs ........................................................................................................................ $30.00 each dog 

Event fee - cats ............................................................................................................................ 20.00 each cat 

  

Recoupment of enforcement costs - hourly rate ........................................................................$53.00 per hour 

 

Administrative fee - clearing violation of 6.08.280 within 10 days .............. $60.00 per animal within 10 days 

Administrative fee - clearing home quarantine violation within 10 days ........ 50.00 per animal within 10 days 

  

Hearing Appeal Processing fee for Potentially Dangerous/Dangerous Animals (6.16) ........ $20.00 per animal 

 

 

Public Spay and Neuter 
Spay and Neuter Fee - Dog ...................................................................................................... $75.00 each dog 

Spay and Neuter Fee - Cat........................................................................................................... 35.00 each cat 

  

 

State Mandate Spay and Neuter 
Spay/neuter deposit - dog (State Mandate - Food/Agricultural Code 30503) .......................... $40.00 each dog 

Spay/neuter deposit - cat (State Mandate - Food/Agricultural Code 317513)............................. 40.00 each cat 

  

 

Animals - General  
Animal redemption fee - 1st impound ................................................................................... $40.00 per animal 

Animal redemption fee - 2nd impound ................................................................................... 90.00 per animal 

Animal redemption fee - 3rd impound .................................................................................. 150.00 per animal 

  

Maintenance of swine, goats & sheep per day ......................................................... $12.00 per animal/per day 

Maintenance of horses & cattle per day ..................................................................... 20.00 per animal/per day 

Maintenance of ponies per day ...................................................................................... 20.00 per pony/per day 

Maintenance of fowl per day ............................................................................................ 5.00 per fowl/per day 

 

Impound Fees – horses, cattle, ponies, sheep, goats and adult swine 

Impound Fee - Large animal (horse, cow, etc) ...................................................................... $75.00 per animal 

Impound Fee - Medium animal (pig, sheet, etc) ..................................................................... 60.00 per animal 

Impound Fee - Small animal ..................................................................................................... 5.00 per animal 

Impound Fee - After-Hours Charge ........................................................................................ 90.00 per animal 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ATTACHMENT 3 - Page 2 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 3 

  

Kennels 

 
 Residential kennel/cattery license fee – 1 year…………………………………………………………..$100.00 

 Commercial kennel/cattery license fee – 1 year…………………………………………………….…….500.00 

 

Fines 
Items below are Fines imposed by the County of Riverside or State of California 

Fine - Failure to produce animal for immediate seizure 

after demanded by Hearing Officer ............................................................................. $100 - $1000 per animal 

 

State mandated - impound 

Fine - State mandated unaltered fine - 1st impound 

(Food/Ag Code 30804.7 & 31751.7) ..................................................................................... $35.00 per animal 

Fine - State mandated unaltered fine - 2nd impound 

(Food/Ag Code 30804.7 & 31751.7) ....................................................................................... 50.00 per animal 

Fine - State mandated unaltered fine - 3rd impound 

(Food/Ag Code 30804.7 & 31751.7) ..................................................................................... 100.00 per animal 

 

Fine - Violation of home quarantine, failure to produce animal 

for quarantine or interfering with rabies investigation – 

charge per day of violation ............................................... $100 - $1000 or up to 1 year imprisonment, or both 

 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 3 - Page 3 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 4 

 
 
  The following charges are hereby established for the sale of digital Computer 
Aided Design, Mapping & Engineering (CADME) data products with a minimum purchase 
price of $250: 
 
             Coverage               1/8 Square Mile         Citywide 
 Photo  $50   $10,000 
 Land base $125  $20,000 
 Cadastral $250  $50,000 
 Storm  $50  $10,000 
 Sewer  $50  $10,000 
 Electric $325  $60,000 
 Water  $250  $50,000 
 Planning $125  $20,000 
 
     In addition, there is hereby established a $1.00 charge for floppy disks and a $15.00 
charge for 8mm tapes. 
 
 The subsets of digital data that can be derived from the above coverages will have a cost 
recovery assigned to them as a percentage of the entire layer, which subsets shall only be 
available as citywide coverages. 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 4 - Page 1 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 5 

 
  In accordance with the provisions of Chapter 9.48 of the Riverside Municipal Code 
and Section 9.48.080 the following fees are established: 
 
An annual fee of $219.00 per year for the filing of Hazardous Materials Disclosure Forms for 
those businesses in Category I which includes: 
 
  (a)   One but less than 120 gallons (two 55-gallon drums). 
  (b)    Ten but less than 1200 pounds. 
  (c)    Ten but less than 1000 cubic feet of compressed gas cylinders. 
  (d) Any known or suspected carcinogen, Class A poison, Class a or B 

explosive, but less than 120 gallons, 1200 pounds, or 1000 cubic feet of 
compressed gas. 

  (e) One pound but less than 1200 pounds of organic peroxide. 
  (f) Any amount of radioactive material listed in Chapter 1, Title 10, Appendix B, 

of the Nuclear Regulatory Commission Report. 
  (g) Extremely Hazardous Substance up to 55 gallons, 250 pounds or 500 cubic 

feet of compressed gas cylinders. 
 
An annual fee of $623.00 per year for the filing of the Hazardous Materials Disclosure 
Forms for those businesses in Category II which includes: 
 
  (a)  Between 120 and 1200 gallons. 
  (b)  Between 1200 and 12,000 pounds. 
  (c)  Between 1000 and 2000 cubic feet. 
  (d)  Between 55 and 120 gallons of Extremely Hazardous Substance (“EHS”). 
  (e)  Between 250 and 1200 pounds of EHS. 
  (f)  Between 500 and 1000 cubic feet of EHS. 
 
An annual fee of $1,163.00 per year for the filing of Hazardous Materials Disclosure Forms 
for those businesses in Category III which include: 
 
  (a) Greater than 1200 gallons. 
  (b) Greater than 12,000 pounds.   
  (c) Greater than 2000 cubic feet. 
  (d) Greater than 120 gallons of Extremely Hazardous Substance (“EHS”). 
  (e) Greater than 1200 pounds of EHS. 
  (f) Greater than 1000 cubic feet of EHS. 
 
  There shall be a late filing fee of 20% of the base fees as established herein 
above, applicable when an invoice is 30 days past due; and 100% when an invoice is 60 
days past due. 
  
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 5 - Page 1 



Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 
ATTACHMENT 6 

 
  The following fees shall be charged for the use of the facilities of the Parks, 
Recreation and Community Services Department (PRCS); provided, however, no fee shall 
be charged for Departmental programs, or City functions.  Priority for the reservations of the 
below referenced facilities will be given to residents. 
 
  Group I shall mean those organizations whose activities are officially co-sponsored 
by the PRCS Department and includes public schools (excepting physical education 
classes) or other educational, community service, faith based, or civic organizations based 
within the corporate limits of the City of Riverside and possessing a non-profit status as 
determined by the Internal Revenue Service, provided, however, to be eligible as a Group I, 
such organization shall not charge a fee for the event and the activity is open to the public.  
Group II includes Riverside City residents and all other non-profit groups not eligible to be 
considered as a Group I organization. Group III includes all other entities not eligible to be 
considered as a Group I or Group II organization, for example: commercial, political 
(excluding open forum and debates) or out-of-City groups.  Rental facilities are classified 
into one of four tiers based on a review of the following five characteristics, 1) 
façade/appearance; 2) location/ease of access; 3) amenities; 4) surrounding neighborhood; 
and 5) demand; with tier one facilities having the highest overall rankings. Tier designation 
and availability are subject to change as a result of various capital improvement projects.   
All rates are hourly. The commercial catering kitchen is available as a separate standalone 
rental on an hourly basis as well. All rentals shall be for a two hour minimum. 
 
If security is required, the applicant shall pay for this service by a reputable security firm 
approved by the Parks, Recreation and Community Services Director or pay for service 
provided by the City of Riverside Police Department.  Security requirements are at the 
discretion of the Parks, Recreation and Community Services Director. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 6 - Page 1 
 



 
Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 

ATTACHMENT 6 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 6 - Page 2 

COMMUNITY CENTER RENTAL RATES

Facilities T I E R 1 T I E R 2 T I E R 3 T I E R 4

Large Rooms Group I Group II Group III Group I Group II Group III Group I Group II Group III Group I Group II Group III

Auditorium 95$      115$     160$      90$      110$     150$       85$       105$     145$      70$      85$        120$      

Ballroom, Grand 160$    200$     280$      150$    190$     265$       145$     180$     250$      120$    150$      210$      

  Half Grand Ballroom 105$    130$     180$      100$    125$     170$       95$       115$     160$      80$      100$      135$      

Banquet Room 125$    160$     220$      120$    150$     210$       115$     145$     200$      95$      120$      165$      

Gym 80$      100$     140$      75$      95$       135$       70$       90$       125$      60$      75$        105$      

  Half Gym 50$      60$       85$        45$      55$       80$         40$       55$       75$        35$      45$        65$        

Multi-purpose Room (large) 80$      100$     140$      75$      95$       135$       70$       90$       125$      60$      75$        105$      

  Half Multi-purpose Room (large) 50$      60$       85$        50$      55$       80$         45$       55$       75$        40$      45$        65$        

Smaller Rooms

Arts & Craft/Dance/Homework Room 35$      45$       65$        35$      45$       60$         30$       40$       60$        25$      35$        50$        

Conference Room 45$      60$       80$        45$      55$       75$         40$       55$       70$        35$      45$        60$        

Counseling Office/Exam Room 20$      25$       40$        20$      25$       40$         20$       25$       35$        15$      20$        30$        

Classroom/Meeting Room 30$      40$       55$        30$      40$       50$         25$       35$       50$        25$      30$        40$        

Multi-purpose Room 55$      60$       85$        50$      55$       80$         45$       55$       75$        40$      45$        65$        

Teen Lounge 45$      55$       75$        45$      50$       70$         40$       50$       70$        35$      40$        55$        

Kitchens

  With rental of Banquet or Ballroom

    Included in rental

  Without rental of Banquet or Ballroom

    Commercial - catering 90$      110$     155$      85$      105$     145$       80$       100$     140$      70$      85$        115$      

Items Available at an Additional Charge (flat rate):

Stage or Dance Floor 150$    

Projector and Screen 125$    

TV and DVD Player 75$      

Public Address System 50$      

Portable Bar 50$      

Speaker Podium 50$      

Court Yard Umbrella 40$      Each

E-Z Ups (white only) 40$      Each

Tier 1 Facilities available at - Hunt Park, La Sierra Senior Center, Orange Terrace Park.

Tier 2 Facilities available at - Dales Senior Center (White), Lakeside Room (Fairmount), Reid Clubhouse, Stratton Center (Bordwell), Villegas Park.

Tier 3 Facilities available at - Bryant Park, Bonds Park, La Sierra Park, Youth Opportunity Center (Bonds).

Tier 4 Facilities available at - Izzak Walton (Fairmount), Joyce Jackson Center (Nichols), Ruth Lewis Center (Reid), Solander Center (Bryant), Lincoln Park.

Shaded areas indicate current unavailability.  Tier designation and availability are subject to change.



 
Riverside Fees and Charges Schedule 

ATTACHMENT 7 
 
 
  The following general admission fee schedule is hereby established for the 
recreational swimming program: 
 
Participant   Single Admission*   Full Season Pass**  Half Season Pass** 
 
Child - 0-17   $1.00 (resident)     $24.00      $14.00 
 
Adult - 18 thru  $2.50 (resident)              $60.00      $35.00 
59 years of age  
 
Senior - 60 years  $1.75 (resident)     $42.00      $24.00 
of age and older  
 
Family Pass      N/A               $130.00      $67.00 
(No more than 4  
members per pass) 
 
Each additional family  N/A        $10.00      $6.00 
member over four 
members 
 
 

*Non-resident participants shall be assessed an additional $.25 for Children 0-17, an 
additional $.75 for Adults ages 18 thru 59, and an additional $.50 for Seniors 60 years of 
age and older. 

 
 
 **Non-resident participants shall be assessed a fee equal to 50% of the resident fee 
 added to the resident fees as set forth above. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ATTACHMENT 7 - Page 1 
 


	1.pdf
	2.pdf

